
 

Sunday Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday Saturday 
      1. Pray for the rest 

and peace of 
students as they 
finish their first week 
of classes. 

2. Lord, we pray that 
Pepperdine students 
would remain 
steadfast in God’s 
Word. 

3. Pray for the 
motivation of 
students, as well as 
their spiritual growth 
and educational 
growth. 

4. Pray that students 
would be spiritually 
involved at 
Pepperdine and see 
Christ’s love 
demonstrated. 

5. Pray for the 
Culturefest Club Fair 
and that students 
find new ways to 
bond through clubs 
on campus. 

6. Pray for the 
financial support 
and support of 
donors for 
Pepperdine 
University. 

7. Pray for the 
success of the first 
Coffeehouse of the 
year and that 
student performers 
would feel peace. 

8. Lord, bless this 
Step Forward Day 
and reach those 
who need you 
through this day of 
service. 

9. Pray for the 
logistics and peace 
of the HRL staff in 
this 2018-2019 
academic year 

10. Pray for 
President Benton, 
that God would 
continue to guide 
him and comfort 
him. 

11. Lord, how can it 
be 16 years since 
the attacks? Please 
love on those that 
still suffer the loss of 
a loved one.  

12. Pray that we 
would continually 
worship God for His 
new mercies each 
day. 

13. Pray for the 
safety of 
sophomores 
studying abroad in 
the 2017-2018 year. 

14. Be strong and 
take heart, all you 
who hope in the 
Lord. ~ Psalm 31:24 

15. Pray for 1st year 
and transfer 
students to find their 
special group where 
they feel a healthy 
sense of belonging.  

16. Pray for success 
of Munchin’ n’ 
Minglin’ to help our 
first year students 
relax & bond. 

17. Pray for the 
professors of 
Pepperdine and the 
deliverance of their 
lessons. 

18. Pray for the 
continual 
construction of the 
Pepperdine Seaver 
Campus. 

19. Pray for a 
blessed Founder’s 
Day. Lord, we are 
grateful for George 
Pepperdine’s 
steadfast love. 

20. Pray for the 
student athletes at 
Pepperdine, and for 
their rest and safety 
throughout the year. 

21. It is the first PIT 
of the year – 
Pepperdine Improv 
Troupe.  Pray for 
nervous student 
performers. 

22. Lord, bless our 
students and help 
them enjoy Sunsets 
+ S’Mores in Mullin 
Town Square. 

23. Pray for the 
integration and 
welcoming of 
Pepperdine’s 
International 
students. 

24. Pray for the 
student submissions 
for Intl. Programs 
applications as 
today is the priority 
deadline  

25. Continue to pray 
for the Class of 
2022 and their 
Pepperdine 
journeys. 

26. Pray for the 
continued spiritual 
growth of 
Pepperdine staff 
and faculty. 

27.Pray that God’s 
love at Pepperdine 
would transcend to 
the Malibu 
community. 

28. Lord, help the 
students enjoy time 
away from studies 
tonight as they view 
a movie under the 
stars. 

29.Pray that 
students would 
continually love one 
another. 

30. Thank you Lord 
for a blessed month 
of September and 
Your goodness to 
Pepperdine. 

      

 


